



23 February 2026

FOI Ref 22542

Request - You asked Staffordshire Police (SP) the following:

I am requesting information about how your organisation manages its vehicle fleet. For the purposes of this request, "fleet management software" means any system used to manage vehicle maintenance, inspections, servicing, compliance, or related fleet activities.

Please provide the following information for your current position:

1. Fleet size

The number of vehicles currently operated by your organisation (or the most recent figure held).

NOTE - Where vehicles are managed across multiple departments or directorates, a single aggregated fleet figure is sufficient.

2. Fleet management software usage

Please indicate one of the following:

- Yes – dedicated fleet management software used
- Yes – fleet management functionality provided by a vehicle leasing or hire provider
- No fleet management software used

3. Current fleet management software provider (If applicable).

4. Name of the fleet management software application If different from the provider name (for example, the product or system name).

5. Annual spend

The current annual cost associated with the fleet management software (for example licence, support and/or hosting), if this information is held.

If this information is not held as an annual figure, please state this.

6. Start year

The year in which your organisation began using the current fleet management software provider.

7. Current contract end date

If a fixed-term contract exists, please provide the contract end date.

If the arrangement is rolling or open-ended, please state this.

8. Contract type

Please indicate one of the following:

- Fixed term
- Rolling annual renewal
- Open-ended / no fixed end date

9. Licensing model

Please indicate whether the fleet management software is:



- Subscription-based (for example annual licence or SaaS), or
- Perpetual licence (with or without annual support)

If it is easier, this information may be provided in a simple table.

SP received your request on 17/02/2025 and have processed this under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA).

SP's response to your enquiry is as follows:

SP holds the requested information.

I am requesting information about how your organisation manages its vehicle fleet. For the purposes of this request, "fleet management software" means any system used to manage vehicle maintenance, inspections, servicing, compliance, or related fleet activities.

Please provide the following information for your current position:

- 1. Fleet size

The number of vehicles currently operated by your organisation (or the most recent figure held).

NOTE - Where vehicles are managed across multiple departments or directorates, a single aggregated fleet figure is sufficient. – **Disclosed, 638.**

- 2. Fleet management software usage

Please indicate one of the following:

- Yes – dedicated fleet management software used
- Yes – fleet management functionality provided by a vehicle leasing or hire provider
- No fleet management software used – **Disclosed, yes - dedicated fleet management software used.**

- 3. Current fleet management software provider (If applicable). – **Disclosed, Jaama.**

- 4. Name of the fleet management software application If different from the provider name (for example, the product or system name). – **Disclosed, Key 2.**

- 5. Annual spend

The current annual cost associated with the fleet management software (for example licence, support and/or hosting), if this information is held.

If this information is not held as an annual figure, please state this. – **Disclosed, £26,808.**

- 6. Start year

The year in which your organisation began using the current fleet management software provider. – **Disclosed, 2018.**

- 7. Current contract end date

If a fixed-term contract exists, please provide the contract end date.

If the arrangement is rolling or open-ended, please state this. – **Disclosed, 30 May 2026.**



- 8. Contract type

Please indicate one of the following:

- Fixed term
- Rolling annual renewal
- Open-ended / no fixed end date – **Disclosed, fixed term with extension options.**

- 9. Licensing model

Please indicate whether the fleet management software is:

- Subscription-based (for example annual licence or SaaS), or
- Perpetual licence (with or without annual support) – **Disclosed, subscription-based - annual license.**

Please note that this data has been provided to the best of the ability of SP, subject to the limitation of current recording protocols and systems/software.

Please be advised that all Freedom of Information request responses are published on the SP website although personal details are not included.

Freedom of Information Request Appeals Procedure

1. Who Can Ask for a Review

Any person who has requested information from SP, which has been dealt with under the Freedom of Information Act, is entitled to complain and request an internal review, if they are dissatisfied with the response they received.

2. How to Request a Review

Requests for review of a Freedom of Information request must be made in writing within two months of the date of receipt of this email, and should be addressed to:

IAT@staffordshire.police.uk

Or by Post to:

Information Access Team
Staffordshire Police HQ
PO Box 3167
Stafford
ST16 9JZ

The reference number, date of the request and details of why the review is being requested must be included. Requests for review should be brought to the attention of the Information Access Team within two months of the Force's response to the original FOI request.

3. Review Procedure

Receipt of a request for review will be acknowledged in writing. The review will be conducted by a Supervisor who is independent from the original Decision Maker. The Information Access Team will set a target date for a response. The response will be made as soon as is practicable with the intention to



STAFFORDSHIRE
POLICE

complete the review within 20 working days. In more complex cases the review may take up to 40 working days.

The independent Supervisor will conduct a review of the handling of the request for information and of decisions taken, including decisions taken about where the public interest lies in respect of exempt information where applicable. The review enables a re-evaluation of the case, taking into account the matters raised by the complaint.

4. Conclusion of the Appeal

On completion of the review the Independent Supervisor will reply to the appellant with the result of the review. If the appellant is still dissatisfied following the review they should contact the Information Commissioner to make an appeal. The Information Commissioner can be contacted via the following link: <https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/foi-and-eir-complaints/foi-and-eir-complaints/>

Freedom of Information
Information Access Team