



STAFFORDSHIRE
POLICE

19 September 2025

FOI Ref 21788

Request - You asked us the following:

I am writing to request information on the costs incurred by your force via the following activities. Please treat each activity as a separate request, meaning that, where information for one is unavailable, please provide me with information on the others. Please only provide me with information dating between 1 July 2024 and 20 August 2025.

1. The prosecution of members of Palestine Action under counter-terror laws;
2. The prosecution of members of Palestine Action under laws which do not constitute counter-terror laws;
3. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out arrests of Palestine Action members.
4. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out investigations into Palestine Action members;
5. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out assessments of Palestine Action as a group, namely, whether it is a terrorist organisation;
6. Any counter-terror measures utilised to detain members of Palestine Action;

If the above can be broken down into the operations targeting each of the following, please do so.

So, if an investigation was carried out into individuals included in (a), (b),

(c) and (i), please clarify that, where appropriate, for example. Please note costs unrelated to (a)-(m) below as 'Other' and provide a brief description of where the costs stemmed from, if possible.

- a. [REDACTED] 30, of Stoke Newington High Street, London b. [REDACTED], 28, of Upper Clapton Road, Hackney, London c. [REDACTED], 28, of Clifden Road, Hackney, London d. [REDACTED] 20, of Commonsidge, East Mitcham, Merton e. [REDACTED], 20, of Selborne Road, Southgate, Enfield f. [REDACTED], 51, of Calder Gardens, Edinburgh g. [REDACTED], 45, of Regent Place, Royal Leamington Spa h. [REDACTED], 33, of High Croft Avenue, Manchester i. [REDACTED], 29, of Wester Drylaw Drive, Edinburgh j. [REDACTED], 22, of Rock Hill, Georgeham, Devon was also charged with GBH with intent and two counts of ABH k. The four people arrested in this case: Four activists who staged protests outside a defence firm have been arrested.
- l. The arrests made in relation to the break-in at RAF Brize Norton.
- m. Arrests made in protests showing support for Palestine Action.

We received your request on 25/08/2025 and have processed this under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA).

Staffordshire Police's response to your enquiry is as follows:

Staffordshire Police holds/does not hold the requested information.

- 1. The prosecution of members of Palestine Action under counter-terror laws; - **No information held.**
- 2. The prosecution of members of Palestine Action under laws which do not constitute counter-terror laws; - **No information held.**



- 3. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out arrests of Palestine Action members. - **No information held.**
- 4. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out investigations into Palestine Action members; - **No information held.**
- 5. Any counter-terror measures utilised to carry out assessments of Palestine Action as a group, namely, whether it is a terrorist organisation; - **No information held.**
- 6. Any counter-terror measures utilised to detain members of Palestine Action; - **No information held.**

If the above can be broken down into the operations targeting each of the following, please do so. So, if an investigation was carried out into individuals included in (a), (b), (c) and (i), please clarify that, where appropriate, for example. Please note costs unrelated to (a)-(m) below as 'Other' and provide a brief description of where the costs stemmed from, if possible.

- a. [REDACTED] 30, of Stoke Newington High Street, London b. [REDACTED], 28, of Upper Clapton Road, Hackney, London c. [REDACTED], 28, of Clifden Road, Hackney, London d. [REDACTED] 20, of Commonsides, East Mitcham, Merton e. [REDACTED], 20, of Selborne Road, Southgate, Enfield f. [REDACTED], 51, of Calder Gardens, Edinburgh g. [REDACTED], 45, of Regent Place, Royal Leamington Spa h. [REDACTED], 33, of High Croft Avenue, Manchester i. [REDACTED], 29, of Wester Drylaw Drive, Edinburgh j. [REDACTED], 22, of Rock Hill, Georgeham, Devon was also charged with GBH with intent and two counts of ABH k. The four people arrested in this case: Four activists who staged protests outside a defence firm have been arrested. - **No information held.**
- l. The arrests made in relation to the break-in at RAF Brize Norton. - **No information held.**
- m. Arrests made in protests showing support for Palestine Action. - **No information held.**

Please note that Staffordshire Police do not record cost information as requested.

Please note that the Freedom of Information Act 2000 only extends to requests for recorded information. It does not require public authorities to create information to answer questions generally; only if the information is already held in recorded form.

Please be advised that all Freedom of Information request responses are published on the Staffordshire Police website although personal details are not included.

Freedom of Information Request Appeals Procedure

1. Who Can Ask for a Review

Any person who has requested information from Staffordshire Police, which has been dealt with under the Freedom of Information Act, is entitled to complain and request an internal review, if they are dissatisfied with the response they received.



STAFFORDSHIRE
POLICE

2. How to Request a Review

Requests for review of a Freedom of Information request must be made in writing within two months of the date of receipt of this email, and should be addressed to:

foi@staffordshire.police.uk

Or by Post to:

Information Access Team
Staffordshire Police HQ
PO Box 3167
Stafford
ST16 9JZ

The reference number, date of the request and details of why the review is being requested must be included. Requests for review should be brought to the attention of the Information Access Team within two months of the Force's response to the original FOI request.

3. Review Procedure

Receipt of a request for review will be acknowledged in writing. The review will be conducted by a Supervisor who is independent from the original Decision Maker. The Information Access Team will set a target date for a response. The response will be made as soon as is practicable with the intention to complete the review within 20 working days. In more complex cases the review may take up to 40 working days.

The independent Supervisor will conduct a review of the handling of the request for information and of decisions taken, including decisions taken about where the public interest lies in respect of exempt information where applicable. The review enables a re-evaluation of the case, taking into account the matters raised by the complaint.

4. Conclusion of the Appeal

On completion of the review the Independent Supervisor will reply to the appellant with the result of the review. If the appellant is still dissatisfied following the review they should contact the Information Commissioner to make an appeal. The Information Commissioner can be contacted via the following link: <https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/foi-and-eir-complaints/foi-and-eir-complaints/>

Freedom of Information
Information Access Team