Unidentified Flying Object/Unidentified Aerial Phenomena sightings for the period 1st January 2024 to
the 31st of December 2024, including the following keywords:
UFO, UAP, UAV, USO, lights in the sky, aliens, extra-terrestrial beings, drones, orbs.

Date and Time Received

(DD/MM/YYYY Local Policing Team Incident Log
HH:MM:SS)
PRIOR TO GOING MISSING HE WAS TALKING ABOUT HIS
16/01/2024 <OT south Lp | PEATH AND BECOMING INCREASINGLY PARANOID THAT
10:09:29 THE POLICE WERE FOLLOWING HIM AND DRONES WERE
FOLLOWING HIM
21/01/2022 DRONES GOING AROUND THE ESTATE - LARGE DRONES -
71756 Stafford Borough LPT| | CAN SEE THE LIGHTS. DRONES FLYING AROUND THE
ESTATE THROUGHOUT THE NIGHT.
27/01/2024 I DON'T KNOW A LOT ABOUT DRONES BUT I'VE
5008 SOT South LPT | GOOGLED AND IT SAYS HE SHOULDN'T USE IT UNLESS
IT'S UNDER 250G
272/0 ():;g ?224 Stafford Borough LPT|  THEY HAVE DRONES OUT AND UP IN THE AREA
29/01/2024 Newcastle District | | HAVE NEVER HAD CARS SAT OUTSIDE AND DRONES
23:08:14 LPT GOING UP
30/01/2024 THREAT IS TO THE PERSON, CALLER REPORTING DRONES
739617 Stafford Borough LPT FLYING OVER HER ESTATE - THIS IS A REGULAR
OCCURENCE. THREAT IS IN PERSON
OFFICERS TO ATTEND ASAP TO TRY TO DISBAND THE
STREET RACERS - SAFEGUARD MOTORISTS AND
PROTECT PEOPLE'S RIGHT TO PRIVACY RE DRONES
04/02/2024 FLYING OVER HEAD. REPORT OF BOY RACERS AND
Stafford Borough LPT .
20:25:28 DRONES FLYING OVER PEOPLE'S GARDENS.NEGATIVE
AREA CHECK FOR ANY VEHICLES IN THE AREA, OR ANY
DRONES BEING SEEN. THE CARS AND DRONES HAVE
NOW GONE.
07/02/2024 <OT South LPT HE PUT TIN FOIL ON THE WINDOWS THE OTHER DAY
21:14:34 THINKING DRONES WERE OUTSIDE
10/02/2024 Staffordshire THERE ARE 2 DRONES SIGHTED FLYING OVER PRISON.
22:46:04 Moorlands LPT
THERE ARE DRONES ABOVE THE PRISON, THEY ARE
12/02/2024 Staffordshire REALLY HIGH IN THE SKY AND NOT HOVERING JUST
00:42:46 Moorlands LPT | ABOVE THE PRISON GROUNDS, THE FLASHING LIGHTS
ON THEM ARE VISIBLE.
17/02/2024 Newcastle District THERE ARE DRONES IN THE SKY
21:22:57 LPT
2 OR 3 ARE BIG DRONES CIRCLING THE TOWN.
212/2 Oié ?3224 Stafford Borough LPT| INFORMANT KEEPS GIVING DIFFERENT STREET NAMES
AND MENTIONING DRONES AND THEN BOY RACERS
26/02/2024 <OT South LpT THERE HAS BEEN A LOT OF DRONES GOING ROUND
20:35:57 RECENTLY




OFFICERS SHOWN FOOTAGE OF WHAT SHE HAS

28/02/2024 o
csean Lichfield District LPT | BELIEVED TO BE DRONES ATTACKING HER CAMERAS.
o *SECTON 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
01/03/2024 ot Seafte Lpy | ME'S FOLLOWED ME WITH DRONES WHICH | HAVE SEEN
21:41:20 OVER MY HOUSE. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
05/03/2024 HES SAYING ALIENS ARE AFTER HIM, HES NOT BEING
1505 East Staffs LPT | AGGRESSIVE. THOUGHT TO BE ON DRUGS AS TALKING
e ABOUT ALIENS AND BEEN SICK 5 TIMES.
14/03/2024 SCHOOL HAVE ASKED BUILDERS NEARBY TO ASK IF THEY
K Lichfield District LPT |HAVE HAD ANY DRONES UP FOR SURVEYING AND HAD A
o NEGATIVE RESPONSE.
29/03/2024 | CAN HEAR A WOMAN SCREAMING ARE THE DRONES
Not recorded
02:48:40 OUT?
THE CALLER STATES THERE IS DRONES EVERYWHERE.
08/04/2024 THE DRONES HE HAS REPORTED ARE BIN BAGS THAT
South Staffs LPT
08:27:29 HAVE BECOME CAUGHT IN A TREE TO THE REAR OF THE
PROPERTY.
18/04/2024 HAD ISSUE WITH NEIGHBOUR IT STARTED WITH DRONES
Tamworth LPT
11:50:09 WITH CAMERAS ON COMING IN TO GARDEN.
02/05/2024 TWO DRONES FLYING OVER THE A ND E DEPT RECORDED
SOT South LPT
21:16:01 PATIENTS AND STAFF IN THE AREA.
051/80.‘;’?2:4 SOT North LPT TALKING ABOUT ALIENS TORTURING HIM
IP STATES SHE WAS WALKING ROUND THE PARK. SHE
08/05/2024 STATES HE WAS FLYING DRONES APPROXIMATELY A
P East Staffs LPT FOOT AWAY. HE HAS HIS DRONE EQUIPMENT LAYED
0 OUT ON PLAY EQUIPMENT. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION
APPLIED*
10/05/2024 | AM CALLING FROM HMP OAKWOOD AND THERE ARE A
South Staffs LPT
23:39:59 LOT OF DRONES IN THE AIR THIS EVENINGS
122{)92(/)?2624 East Staffs LPT | NUMBER OF SPECTATORS AND DRONES BEING SET UP
THERE IS NO CCTV, THE SHED HAS A DOOR AND THEYVE
18/05/2024 Staffordshire | Jo\ b0 1T TO GET IN, WEVE HAD DRONES FLYING ABOUT
08:55:25 Moorlands LPT ’
IN THE VILLAGE.
CALL HAS COME THROUGH FROM HMP OAKWOOD
27/05/2024 STATING THAT THERE WERE 2 DRONES CIRCULATING
South Staffs LPT
23:28:38 AROUND THE PRISON AND ALSO FEATHERSTONE, THEY
HAVE BEEN THERE FOR 5-6 MINS.
WHILST | WAS TALKING TO HIM HE SAID THAT HE HAS
18/06/2024 Newcastle District | 0 JNES , SHOTGUNS, HANDGUNS AND PISTOLS AT
14:47:51 LPT ’ ’
HOME.

20/06/2024 Not recordeq | THERE HAVE BEEN DRONES FLYING OVER MY GARDEN -
10:04:36 SOMEONE CLIMBED OVER THE BACK YARD AS WELL
20/06/2024 THERE ARE STRICT GUIDELINES FOR FLYING DRONES SO

Cannock Chase LPT
14:50:41 WE CAN PROSECUTE IF THEY ARE BEING BROKEN.
NO THREAT AT THIS TIME, CALLER IS SAFE INDOORS -
10/07/2024 SAYS HE THINKS HE IS BEING FOLLOWED AND STALKED
Stafford Borough LPT
00:05:23 BY DRONES 24/7 AND THIS HAS BEEN GOING ON FOR

MONTHS.




10/07/2024

Stafford Borough LPT

WHY DO POLICE USE DRONES TO FOLLOW PEOPLE?

00:05:23
21/07/2024 IT BEEN GOING ON FOR AGES -1 DO NOT KNOW - THEY
18:48:32 East Staffs LPT COLLECT AND OFTEN HAVE DRONES UP WATCHING FOR
o POLICE CARS.
22/07/2024 CHECK ITS POSSIBLE THESE ARE VIEWED BY DRONES OR
South Staffs LPT
11:23:03 PRISONERS PRIOR TO DROP OFFS.
| HAVE SPOKEN TO THE PRISON DIRECT. IT APPEARS
25/07/2024 THAT DRONES HAVE BEEN FLOWN OVER THE PRISON
South Staffs LPT
01:44:53 FOR THE LAST 5 DAYS. THERE WERE 3 DRONES FLYING
AROUND LAST NIGHT AS WELL
26/07/2024 SHE IS A FLIGHT RISK AND THERE ARE CONCERNS RE
12:35:34 SOT South LPT EXPLOITATION. SHE BELEIVES DRONES ARE AFTER HER.
o *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
26/07/2024 HIS ROOM HAS LOTS OF PAINTINGS AND DRAWINGS IN
14:28:41 SOT South LPT BUT THESE ARE ABOUT ALIENS AND DONT MAKE MUCH
o SENSE. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
28/07/2024 BEHAVIOUR HAS GRADUALLY GOT WORSE WHERE SHE
09:59:17 South Staffs LPT BELIEVES THAT PEOPLE ARE WATCHING HER AND
o UNDER SURVEILLANCE FROM DRONES.
01/08/2024
0/1'22.52 South Staffs LPT CURRENTLY 3 DRONES ARE OVER THE PRISON.
04/08/2024 THESE IDIOTS ARE OUT SMARTING THE POLICE THEY ARE
East Staffs LPT
19:44:10 USING DRONES TO LOOK FOR YOU.
07/08/2024 Staffordshire IP HAS STATED THAT SHE HAS SEEN DRONES IN THE
23:04:23 Moorlands LPT SKY. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
08/08/2024 IP BELIEVES THAT HE IS BEING TAKEN TO A TORTURE
15:13:39 SOT South LPT CHAMBER BY ALIENS EVERY DAY AND THAT HIS BODY IS
o FULL OF BIOTECH. *SECTION 40 EXEMPT*
10/08/2024 Newcastle District AREA SEARCH AND NO PERSONS OR DRONES PRESENT
00:09:14 LPT IN THE SURROUNDING AREA
10/08/2024 South Staffs LPT WE HAVE HAD DRONES FLYING RECENTLY AND IT
00:52:38 DROPPED A PACKAGE.
11/08/2024
/08/ South Staffs LPT REPORT OF DRONES FLYING OVER THE PRISON.
23:46:02
L THE BOYS WERE PLAYING BALL IN THE BACK GARDEN
13/08/2024 Newcastle District
17:40:58 LPT AND THE BALL WENT OVER THE FENCE - SHE MESSAGED
o ME SAYING "MY DOG THOUGHT THAT WAS A UFQ"
OCCUPANTS FROM HAVE HAD A SMALL NEW DRONE
16/08/2024 Staffordshire THIS WEEK (249G) WHICH THEY HAVE TESTED OUT
23:21:58 Moorlands LPT FROM THEIR BACK GARDEN. THEY ARE WELL AWARE OF
THE LAWS AROUND THE USAGE OF DRONES
25/08/2024 SOT South LPT HE TALKS ABOUT ALIENS ETC
14:22:01
THERE IS NO OFFENCE THAT COVERS DRONES UNDER A
10/09/2024 CERTAIN WEIGHT. IT IS BELIEVED THAT THE DRONE WAS
Cannock Chase LPT
06:53:49 UNDER THIS WEIGHT SO NO CRIMINAL OFFENCE
COMMITTED
24/09/2024

23:29:02

Stafford Borough LPT

SUSPICIOUS INCIDENT - TWO DRONES FLYING OVER.




HE HAS A LICENCE AND KNOWS ALL THE REGULATIONS

28/09/2024 SOT North LPT ABOUT DRONES AND STATES THAT HE WAS NOT
15:17:09 RECORDING ANYTHING. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION
APPLIED*
30/09/2024 HE RESIDES IN THE AREA, OWNS A LANDSCAPING OR
18:42:11 Cannock Chase LPT | GARDENING BUSINESS, AND REGULARLY FLIES DRONES
o IN THE AREA. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION APPLIED*
01/10/2024
/10/ South Staffs LPT NO DRONES FOUND / SEEN
16:04:11
04/10/2024 e L. THERE HAVE BEEN A NUMBER OF REPORTS OF DRONES
Lichfield District LPT
18:19:22 FLYING OVER/NEAR TO THE PRISON.
08/10/2024 MULTIPLE DRONES ARE BEING OPERATED BY SEPARATE
10:24:58 Lichfield District LPT | INDIVIDUALS, 1 OF THE DRONES APPEARS TO BE OF A
o VERY LARGE SIZE
12{)1222234 South Staffs LPT REPORT OF DRONES FLYING OVER THE PRISON.
15/10/2024
/10/ Lichfield District LPT 2 DRONES FLYING OVER PRISON.
13:21:33
16/10/2024 e L. DRONES SEEN FLYING ALONG PERIMETER FENCING FOR
Lichfield District LPT
12:17:16 UNKNOWN REASON.
17/10/2024 Lichfield District LPT DRONES CAN BE SEEN FLYING OVER THE
17:14:00 ESTABLISHMENT
THERE WAS CONCERNS IN RELATION TO THE PREVIOUS
19/10/2024 INCIDENTS OF DRONES AT THE LOCATION. WE HAVE
18:55:33 Lichfield District LPT HAD ITEMS THROWN OVER RECENTLY AND DRONES
o COME OVER. WEVE HAD SEVERAL REPORTS OF DRONES
FLYING OVER SWINFEN.
20/10/2024
0/3_1{)‘44 Lichfield District LPT REPORT OF DRONES FLOWN OVER PRISON ESTATE.
21/10/2024 e L THE DRONES GO THROUGHOUT THE GROUNDS OF THE
Lichfield District LPT
19:38:19 PRISON.
22/10/2024 e I REPORT THAT SWINFEN ARE EXPERIENCING ALOT OF
Lichfield District LPT
19:32:27 ISSUES WITH DRONES OVER THE LAST FEW DAYS
23/10/2024 MALE PRESENTING WITH MENTAL HEALTH ISSUES
11:24:12 Not recorded TALKING ABOUT TRACKING APPS, DRONES AND POLICE
o GETTING APPS DELETED
23/10/2024
/10/ Lichfield District LPT REPORT OF DRONES OVER PRISON.
11:44:25
25/10/2024 e N DRONES THAT HAVE BEEN FLYING OVER THE PRISON
Lichfield District LPT
08:45:03 THIS MORNING.
22/11242854 South Staffs LPT THERE ARE DRONES FLYING AROUND THE PRISON
25/10/2024 THERE ARE DRONES OVER HMP OAKWOOD AT THE
South Staffs LPT
23:29:51 MOMENT
27/10/2024 LICHFIELD NPT ARE AWARE OF THE DAILY ISSUES OF
04:40:20 Lichfield District LPT DRONES AT HMP SWINFEN. NPT WERE IN THE AREA
o LAST NIGHT AND SIGHTED THEM
03/11/2024 RISK - HISTORIC INCIDENT, FORSEEABLE RISK AS THE
10:58:05 Tamworth LPT OPERATOR COULD CONTINUE TO USE THE DRONES IN
e THIS WAY
04/11/2024 PLEASE BE ADVISED AT THE FENTON FIRE WORKS THERE

23:16:50

SOT South LPT

WITH BE SOMEONE FLYING 2 DRONES ABOVE




11/11/2024

Staffordshire

4 DRONES OVER THE PRISON

18:27:41 Moorlands LPT
25/11/2024 REPORT OF TWO DRONES CURRENTLY FLYING OVER
South Staffs LPT
18:58:46 HMP FEATHERSTONE
27/11/2024 south Staffe Lp7 | 'NF REPORTING 3 DRONES OVER THE PREMISES AT
18:50:09 PRESENT
04/12/2024 OFFER ADVICE TO THE CALLER IN RELATION TO DRONES
SOT North LPT
15:04:26 AND PRIVACY CONCERNS WITH THEM
IP STATES THAT ***** HAS SEEN THE DRONES ABOVE
COPPICE WOODS AND HAS BEEN LAUGHING AT POLICE.
16/12/2024 staffordshire IP IS WORRIED THAT ***** SEEMS TO KNOW STUFF
06:03:42 Moorlands LPT
THAT HE SHOULDN'T KNOW. *SECTION 40 EXEMPTION
APPLIED*
22/12/2024
/12/ Not recorded THERE IS DRONES ASWELL
00:40:19
23/12/2024
1/2_0:3'10 Lichfield District LPT REPORT OF DRONES FLYING OVER PRISON
24/12/2024

18:58:58

East Staffs LPT

ALSO SAYING THERE ARE DRONES OUTSIDE




