

4 November 2024

FOI Ref 17375

Request - You asked us the following:

In the aftermath of the Southport murders, Staffordshire police had to deal with serious disorder at a number of venues including Tamworth.

Since those riots a number of individuals have been arrested, charged and convicted.

This request is to ascertain; a) The numbers of those convicted of offences linked to the riots.

b). The numbers of those convicted of offences linked to the riots, as above, who had criminal convictions prior to the riots.

We received your request on 17/10/2024 and have processed this under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA).

Staffordshire Police's response to your enquiry is as follows:

Staffordshire Police does not hold the requested information.

- a) The numbers of those convicted of offences linked to the riots. - **No information held.**
- b). The numbers of those convicted of offences linked to the riots, as above, who had criminal convictions prior to the riots. - **No information held.**

Staffordshire Police do not hold conviction data. This can be obtained via the Government HM Courts and Tribunals Service website.

Please find below links to previously disclosed HMCTS data and details upon how to submit a further Freedom of Information request to the Government HM Courts and Tribunals Service for this information.

Make an FOI request - [how to make a request](#).

Check our previous releases to see if we've already answered your question - [our previous releases](#)

Make a new request by using the details below.

FOI requests
Disclosure Team
Postal Point 10.38, Floor 10
102 Petty France
London
SW1H 9AJ
United Kingdom



STAFFORDSHIRE
POLICE

Email

data.access@justice.gov.uk

Next steps

You can ask us to review our response.

If you would like us to carry out a review of our response, please let us know within two months of the date of receipt of this email, review requests should be addressed to:

foi@staffordshire.police.uk

Or by Post to:

Central Disclosure Unit
Staffordshire Police HQ
PO Box 3167
Stafford
ST16 9JZ

Please remember to quote the reference number in any future communications.

Freedom of Information
Central Disclosure Unit